Bid Tab - Lamination Film 2025 - 2026

Key

Accepted Bid

Item# Item Description u/m EST. QTY Per Item ACCO Brands Leading Edge School Specialty Scott Electric PyraPT;j:::ths ool Vendor:i::icepted Vendor Accepted $
25"x500' Roll, 2 $22.95 $28.95 School
AL 14" Core. 1 Roll 26 No Bid (A+PLUS (1$22717'225) $gfz(585%’§‘)3 (AJLAM# 01- $2;§;;‘5”d Specialty &
1/2mil School) 2552X) ' Leading Edge
$26.95
oy | 257500 Roll 1 ol 495 $22.12 ( /ff;fgs $18.89 $31 (Bryce | (Ployplex# | $18.89 and Spsécc'l‘;‘t’y' 2
Core, 1 1/2mil (MEAD304) School) (1277261) | 012551X) PPX15)25516 $21.49 | | oG Bdge
$27.95
oz | 27500 Roll 1 ol 017 $24.60 (GBC: | ( /ffﬁfjs $20.25 $33 (Bryce | (Polyplex# | $20.25 and Spii':;fy' 2
Core, 11/2mil 3126061) Schoal) (1277262) | 012752C) PPX1CS)2751 $23.24 | | Sh0 Bage
18"x500' Roll, 2 Scott Electric
A-04 1/4" Core, 1 Roll 0 No Bid No Bid (1$22797'22 " $§$1g352’§'§ NoBid |$28&$29.99| & School
1/2mil Specialty
) $16.55 $18.98 School
18"x500' Roll, 1" $16.60 (GBC: $13.70 $30 (Bryce $13.70 and .
A0S | Core, 11/2mil Roll 2 3000003) | (AFPLUS | 4o77260) | o11851x) | (POVPIeX# | " gig 55 | Specialty &
School) PPX15185K) Leading Edge
ey y ) $46.95 $50.89 School
ao | 251500 ol 1 Rol 106 S sy | (ArPLUS | OO0 | $80 Bryce) |(adLaM 03- | HEO AN | Spedialty &
' School) 255-1C) ' Leading Edge
$27.25 $27.85 Leading Edge
i 27"x250' Roll, 1" . : . $36 (Bryce (Plyplex# $27.25 and & Pyramid
A07 Core, 3mil Roll 232 No Bid (’;";(';gl)s No Bid 032731C) | PPX032731 |  $27.85 School
C) Products
Pyramid
. $49.60 $41.95 School
40" x 250" Roll, 1" No Bid (LAMAPLY $92 (Bryce) | (aAdLAM# 03-[$41.95and | Products &
A-08 Core, 3 mil Roll 10 Premium) No Bid 403-1C) $49.60 Leading Edge
aog | AT T Roll 0 No Bid No Bid NoBid  |$103 (Bryce)| NoBid No Bid No Bid




